



**Bid / RFP / RFQ Tabulation**

Date: 7-6-2022

**Bid / RFP / RFQ Number: SB-2022-6 Annual Rock, Gravel, Sand**

**Department:** Expo Type:  Sealed Bid  On-line Bid  RFP  RFQ

Item Description	MUSKOGEE SAND		PRYOR STONE		APAC CENTRAL		ANCHOR STONE		SHERWOOD CONSTRUCTION	
	PRICE PER TON		PRICE PER TON		PRICE PER TON		PRICE PER TON		PRICE PER TON	
	FOB	PLANT	FOB	PLANT	FOB	PLANT	FOB	PLANT	FOB	PLANT
FILL SAND	\$ 16.50	\$ 6.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 19.90	\$ 8.50	NO BID	NO BID
SCREENINGS/MFD SAND	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 6.00
6" GABION ROCK	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 24.00	\$ 14.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 24.66	\$ 17.00	NO BID	\$ 12.00
ODOT 12" TYPE 1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 26.50	\$ 16.50	NO BID	\$ 20.50	\$ 24.66	\$ 17.00	NO BID	\$ 19.00
ODOT 18" TYPE 1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 26.50	\$ 16.50	NO BID	\$ 20.50	\$ 24.66	\$ 17.00	NO BID	\$ 21.00
ODOT 24" TYPE 1	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 26.50	\$ 16.50	NO BID	\$ 20.50	\$ 24.66	\$ 17.00	NO BID	\$ 23.00
ODOT SINGLE COURSE	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18.50	\$ 10.50	NO BID	\$ 10.50	\$ 15.32	\$ 9.75	NO BID	\$ 9.00

**Number of Bids / RFPs / RFQs Received:** 5

**Late Bids / RFPs / RFQs:** \_\_\_\_\_

*Noelle Hays* \_\_\_\_\_ 7-6-2022

Authorized Personnel Signed Date