
       Bid / RFP / RFQ Tabulation             Date:            7-6-2022 

 
104 S. Muskogee                 P. O. Box 249                        Claremore                         Oklahoma  74018                         (918) 

341-1325                           (918) 341-7705 
 

 
Bid / RFP / RFQ Number: SB-2022-7 Annual Asphalt 
 
Department:   Expo   Type: ■ Sealed Bid  □ On-line Bid   □ RFP 

 □ RFQ  
 

Item Description

ALL PRICES 
ADD .35 PER 

MILE 
DELIVERY 
CHARGE

FOB PLANT FOB PLANT FOB PLANT
HOT MIX HOT LAY TYPE A 68.00$          60.00$         68.50$         60.00$           NO BID 56.50$          
HOT MIX HOT LAY TYPE B 72.00$          64.00$         71.50$         63.00$           NO BID 69.00$          
HOT MIX HOT LAY TYPE C 75.00$          67.00$         73.50$         65.00$           NO BID 73.50$          
HOT MIX COLD LAY 107.00$        99.00$         133.50$        125.00$         NO BID NO BID
HOT MIX HOT LAY ODOT S3 68.00$          60.00$         74.50$         66.00$           NO BID 56.50$          
HOT MIX HOT LAY ODOT S4 72.00$          64.00$         76.50$         68.00$           NO BID 83.50$          
HOT MIX HOT LAY ODOT S5 75.00$          67.00$         77.50$         69.00$           NO BID 86.50$          

TULSA ASPHALT PRYOR ASPHALT APAC

PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON

 
Number of Bids / RFPs / RFQs Received:         3 
Late Bids / RFPs / RFQs:       

                 7-6-2022       
Authorized Personnel Signed     Date  


