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Claremore

Bid / RFP / RFQ Tabulation

Date: 6-20-2023

Bid / RFP / RFQ Number: SB-2023-7 Annual Sand, Gravel and Rock

Department: Public Infrastructure Type: W Sealed Bid 0O On-line Bid O RFP ORFQ

Item Description Anchor Stone Pryor Stone
PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON
FOB PLANT FOB PLANT
1-1/2" CLASS A ROCK $ 16.80 1 $ 9.50 $§ 20501 § 12.00
3/4" CRUSHER RUN $ 14.80 1 $ 7.50 $§ 17.00] § 8.50
3/8" CHIPS $ 18.30 | $ 11.00 $ 21501 % 13.00
SCREENINGS $ 13808 650l ]s 1850] s 10.00
FILL SAND $ 21751 $ 9.00 $§ 33901 § 25.40
ODOT NO. 57 AGGREGATE $ 16.80 ] $ 9.50 $§ 21501 § 13.00
ODOT TYPE A AGG BASE $ 14.80 | $ 7.50 $§ 18501 § 10.00
ODOT TYPE B AGG BASE $ 1580  s8s50]]s 1850] s 10.00
ODOT TYPE C AGG BASE NO BID | NO BID NO BID | NO BID
ODOT TYPE D AGG BASE $ 16.80 ] $ 9.50 § 21501 § 13.00
ODOT 12" TYPE | $ 29221 $ 19.00 $§ 28501 ¢ 17.50
ODOT 18" TYPE | $ 2995]s 1900]]s 2850]s 1750
ODOT 24" TYPE | $ 2995]s 1900]]s 2850]s 1750
ODOT SING CRSE FILBLNKT [ 3 1780 s 1050] | s 1950]$ 11.00
TOTAL $ 256.57 | $ 146.00 | | $296.40 | $178.40
Number of Bids / RFPs / RFQs Received: 2
Late Bids / RFPs / RFQs: 0
ey e 6-20-2023
Authorized Personnel Signed Date
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