[WE]
GLAREMORE

—d Bid / RFP / RFQ Tabulation Date: 6-10-2024
Bid / RFP / RFQ Number: SB-2024-14 Annual Hauling
Department: Public Infrastructure Type: W Sealed Bid 0O On-line Bid O RFP ORFQ

Item Description Bear Down Logistics| | Ashlock Construction G & A Express Trucking McGuire Brothers LLC
Method 1A - Per Ton (0 to 5 miles one way) $ 23.53 $ 5.24 NO BID $ 6.75
Method 1B - Per Ton (5 to 15 miles one way) $ 23.53 $ 7.30 NO BID $ 9.50
Method 1C - Per Ton (15 to 25 miles one way) $ 23.53 $ 9.39 NO BID $ 12.25
Method 1D - Per Ton (25 to 35 miles one way) $ 23.53 $ 11.48 NO BID $ 15.00
Method 1E - Per Ton (35 to 50 miles one way) $ 23.53 $ 14.61 NO BID $ 19.00
Method 2A Hourly Haul. (12 to 17 tons) $ 117.50 $ 94.99 $ 100.00 $ 130.00
Method 2B Hourly Haul. (18+ tons) NO BID $ 119.99 NO BID $ 169.00
Method 3A Loaded Mile (12 to 17 tons) $ 23.53 $ 4.99 NO BID $ 6.75
Method 3B Loaded Mile (18+ tons) NO BID $ 5.24 NO BID $ 7.00
Number of Bids / RFPs / RFQs Received: 4
Late Bids / RFPs / RFQs: 0
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104 S. Muskogee P. O. Box 249 Claremore Oklahoma 74018 (918) 341-1325 (918) 341-7705



