[WE]
GLAREMORE

— Bid / RFP / RFQ Tabulation

Date: 6-10-2024

Bid / RFP / RFQ Number: SB-2023-16 Annual Sand, Gravel and Rock

Department: Public Infrastructure Type: W Sealed Bid 0O On-line Bid O RFP ORFQ
Anchor Stone APAC - Central,
Pryor Stone
Item Description Company Inc.
PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON PRICE PER TON

FOB PLANT FOB PLANT FOB PLANT
1" CLASS A ROCK $ 18251 $ 10.50 NOBID | $ 10.75 NO BID NO BID
1" CRUSHER RUN $ 15751 $ 8.00 NOBID | $ 8.50 NO BID NO BID
3/8" CHIPS $ 19751 % 12.00 NOBID | $ 12.50 $ 23.00] $ 14.00
SCREENINGS $ 15251 % 7.50 NOBID | $ 7.50 $ 20.00] $ 11.00
FILL SAND $ 26.25]1 $ 13.00 NO BID NO BID $ 3545]| $ 26.45
ODOT NO. 57 AGGREGATE $ 18.25]1 $ 10.50 NOBID | $ 10.75 $ 22501 $ 13.50
ODOT TYPE A AGG BASE $ 16251 $ 8.50 NOBID | $ 8.75 $ 20.00] $ 11.00
ODOT TYPE B AGG BASE $ 16.25]1 $ 8.50 NOBID | $ 8.75 $ 20.00] $ 11.00
ODOT TYPE C AGG BASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ODOT TYPE D AGG BASE $ 18251 $ 10.50 NO BID NO BID $ 2250] $ 13.50
ODOT 12" TYPE | $ 33631 % 22.00 NOBID 1 $ 23.00 $ 30.00] $ 19.00
ODOT 18" TYPE | $ 33631 $ 22.00 NOBID | $ 23.00 $ 30.00] $ 19.00
ODOT 24" TYPE | $ 33631 $ 22.00 NOBID | $ 23.00 $ 30.00] $ 19.00
ODOT SING CRSE FILBLNKT | $ 18.75]| $ 11.00 NOBID | $ 11.00 $ 21.00| $ 12.00
APAC's $8.50 Crusher Run Plant Location Price is for 3/4"

Number of Bids / RFPs / RFQs Received: 3

Late Bids / RFPs / RFQs: 0
gt e 6-10-2024

Authorized Personnel Signed Date

104 S. Muskogee P. O. Box 249 Claremore Oklahoma 74018 (918) 341-1325 (918) 341-7705



